
Part III. Administrative, Procedural, and Miscellaneous

Weighted Average Interest
Rate Update

Notice 2001–71

Notice 88–73 provides guidelines for
determining the weighted average interest
rate and the resulting permissible range of

interest rates used to calculate current
liability for the purpose of the full fund-
ing limitation of § 412(c)(7) of the Inter-
nal Revenue Code as amended by the
Omnibus Budget Reconciliation Act of
1987 and as further amended by the Uru-
guay Round Agreements Act, Pub. L.
103–465 (GATT).

The average yield on the 30–year
Treasury Constant Maturities for October
2001 is 5.32 percent.

The following rates were determined
for the plan years beginning in the month
shown below.

Month Year
Weighted
Average

90% to 105%
Permissible

Range

90% to 110%
Permissible

Range

November 2001 5.74 5.17 to 6.03 5.17 to 6.32

DRAFTING INFORMATION

The principal author of this notice is
Todd Newman of the Employee Plans,
Tax Exempt and Government Entities
Division. For further information regard-
ing this notice, please call Mr. Newman at
(202) 283–9888 (not a toll-free number).

26 CFR 601.105: Examination of returns and claims
for refund, credit, or abatement; determination of
correct tax liability. (Also Part I, Sections 62, 162,
170, 213, 217, 274, 1016; 1.62–2, 1.162–17,
1.170A–1, 1.213–1, 1.217–2, 1.274–5, 1.1016–3.)

Rev. Proc. 2001–54

SECTION 1. PURPOSE

This revenue procedure updates Rev.
Proc. 2000–48 (2000–49 I.R.B. 570) by
providing optional standard mileage rates
for employees, self-employed individuals,
or other taxpayers to use in computing the
deductible costs of operating an automo-
bile for business, charitable, medical, or
moving expense purposes. This revenue
procedure also provides rules under
which the amount of ordinary and neces-
sary expenses of local travel or transpor-
tation away from home that are paid or
incurred by an employee will be deemed
substantiated under § 1.274–5 of the
Income Tax Regulations when a payor
(the employer, its agent, or a third party)
provides a mileage allowance under a
reimbursement or other expense allow-
ance arrangement to pay for such
expenses. Use of a method of substantia-

36.5 cents per mile
(2) Charitable (section 7 below)

14 cents per mile
(3) Medical and Moving (section 7

below)
13 cents per mile

.02 Determination of standard mileage
rates. The business, medical, and moving
standard mileage rates reflected in this
revenue procedure are based on an annual
study of the fixed and variable costs of
operating an automobile conducted on
behalf of the Internal Revenue Service by
an independent contractor, and the chari-
table standard mileage rate is provided in
§ 170(i) of the Internal Revenue Code.

SECTION 3. BACKGROUND

.01 Section 162(a) allows a deduction
for all the ordinary and necessary
expenses paid or incurred during the tax-
able year in carrying on any trade or busi-
ness. Under that provision, an employee
or self-employed individual may deduct
the cost of operating an automobile to the
extent that it is used in a trade or busi-
ness. However, under § 262, no portion of

may prescribe that some or all of the sub-
stantiation requirements do not apply to
an expense that does not exceed an
amount prescribed by such regulations.

.03 Section 1.274–5(j), in part, grants
the Commissioner of Internal Revenue
the authority to establish a method under
which a taxpayer may use mileage rates
to substantiate, for purposes of § 274(d),
the amount of the ordinary and necessary
expenses of using a vehicle for local
transportation and transportation to, from,
and at the destination while traveling
away from home.

.04 Section 1.274–5(g), in part, grants
the Commissioner the authority to pre-
scribe rules relating to mileage allow-
ances for ordinary and necessary
expenses of using a vehicle for local
transportation and transportation to, from,
and at the destination while traveling
away from home. Pursuant to this grant
of authority, the Commissioner may pre-
scribe rules under which such allowances,
if in accordance with reasonable business
practice, will be regarded as (1) equiva-
lent to substantiation, by adequate records
or other sufficient evidence, of the
amount of such travel and transportation
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