
ments adopted after December 7, 1994,
which would cause an existing plan to fail
to be qualified.

.03 This extension also applies for pur-
poses of the time by which employers
must either adopt an M&P or volume sub-
mitter plan or certify their intent to adopt
a GUST-approved M&P or volume sub-
mitter plan in order to be eligible for the
extension described in section 19 of Rev.
Proc. 2000–20.   However, the December
31, 2000, deadline for submission of ap-
plications for opinion and advisory letters
under section 19 of Rev. Proc. 2000–20 is
not extended.

.04 The TRA ‘86 remedial amendment
period for governmental plans is extended
to the end of the GUST remedial amend-
ment period for governmental plans de-
scribed above.  The TRA ‘86 remedial
amendment period for nonelecting church
plans is extended to the end of the GUST
remedial amendment period for non-
governmental plans described above.
Thus, nonelecting church plans now have
a single amendment deadline for all
GUST and TRA ‘86 plan amendments, in-
cluding amendments relating to the
nondiscrimination requirements.  The ad-
ditional administrative relief provided
under Notice 92–36, 1992–2 C.B. 364,
continues to be available to governmental
and nonelecting church plans through the
end of their respective remedial amend-
ment periods with respect to the applica-
ble nondiscrimination requirements.

SECTION 5.  EXTENSION OF
EXTENDED RELIANCE PERIOD

The TRA ‘86 extended reliance period
is extended by an additional year.  A plan
with extended reliance must be amended
by the end of the GUST remedial amend-
ment period to the extent necessary to
comply with regulations or administrative
guidance of general applicability issued
since the date of the plan’s favorable TRA
‘86 determination letter.  These amend-
ments must be made effective no later
than the first day of the plan year in which
the GUST remedial amendment period
ends, and, except in the case of M&P or
volume submitter plans, no earlier than
the first day of the plan year in which the
amendments are adopted.  (But see Rev.
Rul. 94–76, 1994–2 C.B. 46, and Rev.
Rul. 96–47, 1996–2 C.B. 35.)

SECTION 6.  EFFECT ON OTHER
DOCUMENTS

Rev. Procs. 98–14, 99–23, 2000–6, and
2000–20 are modified.

SECTION 7.  EFFECTIVE DATE

This revenue procedure is effective
June 26, 2000.

DRAFTING INFORMATION

The principal author of this revenue
procedure is James Flannery of the Tax
Exempt and Government Entities Divi-

sion.  For further information regarding
this revenue procedure, contact the Em-
ployee Plans Division’s telephone assis-
tance service between the hours of 1:30
and 3:30 p.m. Eastern time, Monday
through Thursday, on (202) 622-6074/75.
(These telephone numbers are not toll-
free.)   

Weighted Average Interest Rate
Update

Notice 2000–31

Notice 88–73 provides guidelines for
determining the weighted average interest
rate and the resulting permissible range of
interest rates used to calculate current lia-
bility for the purpose of the full funding
limitation of § 412(c)(7) of the Internal
Revenue Code as amended by the Om-
nibus Budget Reconciliation Act of 1987
and as further amended by the Uruguay
Round Agreements Act, Pub. L. 103–465
(GATT).

The average yield on the 30-year Trea-
sury Constant Maturities for May 2000 is
6.15 percent.    

The following rates were determined
for the plan years beginning in the month
shown below.

June 26, 2000 1274 2000–26  I.R.B.

90% to 105% 90% to 110%
Weighted Permissible Permissible 

Month Year Average Range Range 

June 2000 6.01 5.41 to 6.31 5.41 to 6.61

Drafting Information

The principal author of this notice is
Todd Newman of the Employee Plans,
Tax Exempt and Government Entities Di-
vision.  For further information regarding
this notice, call the Employee Plans Actu-
arial hotline, (202) 622-6076 between
2:30 and 3:30 p.m. Eastern time (not a
toll-free number).  Mr. Newman’s number
is (202) 622-8458 (also not a toll-free
number).

Eligible Rollover Distributions

Notice 2000–32

I.  PURPOSE

This notice provides additional relief
relating to the exception to the definition
of eligible rollover distribution for certain
hardship distributions.  This exception
was added to §§ 402(c)(4) and
403(b)(8)(B) of the Internal Revenue
Code (the “Code”) by § 6005(c)(2)(A)

and (B) of the Internal Revenue Service
Restructuring and Reform Act of 1998,
Pub. L. 105–206 (“RRA 98”).  Transition
relief and guidance relating to the excep-
tion was initially provided in Notice
99–5, 1999–3 I.R.B. 10.  In response to
comments from representatives of plan
sponsors and recordkeepers regarding
their significant difficulties in implement-
ing certain requirements of Notice 99–5,
this notice provides permanent relief to
sponsors of qualified plans where records
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