
hibit an individual from being charged, on
the basis of health status, a higher pre-
mium than that charged for similarly situ-
ated individuals enrolled in the plan) with
respect to a disabled qualified beneficiary
described in paragraph (a)(1) of this sec-
tion merely because the plan requires pay-
ment of a premium in an amount permit-
ted under paragraph (a)(4)(i)(A) of this
section.

(ii)  Nondisabled qualified beneficia-
ries. [Reserved].

(b)  Newborns and adopted children. A
child who is born to or placed for adop-
tion with a covered employee during a pe-
riod of COBRA continuation coverage is
a qualified beneficiary and generally is el-
igible to be enrolled immediately for
COBRA continuation coverage under the
plan.  See section 4980B(g)(1)(A), sec-
tion 9801(f)(2) and §54.9801–6T(b) (re-
lating to special enrollment rights of de-
pendents of employees), and Q&A–31 of
§1.162–26 of this chapter (relating to the
right of qualified beneficiaries to have
new family members covered to the same
extent that similarly situated active em-
ployees can have new family members
covered under the plan).  Such a child has
the same open-enrollment-period rights as
other qualified beneficiaries with respect
to the same qualifying event (see Q&A-
30(c) of §1.162–26 of this chapter) and
would be entitled to a 36-month maxi-
mum coverage period if a second qualify-
ing event occurred while the child was in
a period of COBRA continuation cover-
age resulting from a termination-of-em-
ployment qualifying event.  The maxi-
mum coverage period for such a child is
measured from the same date as for other
qualified beneficiaries with respect to the
same qualifying event (and not from the
date of the birth or placement for adop-
tion).  In contrast, neither the covered em-
ployee, the spouse of the covered em-
ployee, nor any other dependent child of
the covered employee is a qualified bene-
ficiary unless that person is covered under
a group health plan on the day before a
qualifying event.  See also Q&A–31 of
§1.162–26 of this chapter.

(c)  Plan providing long-term care.A
plan is not subject to the COBRA continu-
ation coverage requirements if substan-
tially all of the coverage provided under
the plan is for qualified long-term care
services (as defined in section 7702B(c)).

For this purpose, a plan is permitted to
use any reasonable method in determining
whether substantially all of the coverage
under the plan is for qualified long-term
care services.

(d)  Medical savings accounts.Under
section 106(b)(5), amounts contributed by
an employer to a medical savings account
are not considered part of a group health
plan that is subject to section 4980B.
Thus, a plan is not required to make
COBRA continuation coverage available
with respect to a medical savings account.
However, a high deductible health plan
that covers a medical savings account
holder may be a group health plan and
thus may be subject to the COBRA con-
tinuation coverage requirements.

(e)  Definitions. For purposes of this
section — 

Applicable premiumis defined in sec-
tion 4980B(f)(4).

Bankruptcy qualifying eventis a quali-
fying event described in section
4980B(f)(3)(F) (relating to certain bank-
ruptcy proceedings).

Covered employeeis defined in section
4980B(f)(7).

Group health planis defined in section
4980B(g)(2).

High deductible health planis defined
in section 220(c)(2).

Medical savings account is defined in
section 220(d).

Placement, or being placed, for adop-
tion means the assumption and retention
by the covered employee of a legal oblig-
ation for total or partial support of a child
in anticipation of the adoption of the
child.  The child’s placement for adoption
with the covered employee terminates
upon the termination of the legal obliga-
tion for total or partial support.  For pur-
poses of this section and section 4980B, a
child who is immediately adopted by the
covered employee without a preceding
placement for adoption is considered to
be placed for adoption on the date of the
adoption.

Qualified beneficiaryis defined in sec-
tion 4980B(g)(1).

Qualified long-term care servicesis de-
fined in section 7702B(c).

Termination-of-employment qualifying
eventis a qualifying event described in
section 4980B(f)(3)(B) (relating to quali-
fying events that occur as a result of a ter-
mination of employment, other than for

gross misconduct, or reduction of hours
of employment).

Michael P. Dolan,
Deputy Commissioner of 

Internal Revenue.

(Filed by the Office of the Federal Register on
January 6, 1998, 8:45 a.m., and published in the
issue of the Federal Register for January 7, 1998, 63
F.R. 708)

Change in Record Format 
For TY 1998 Returns To Be
Filed in CY 1999

Announcement 98–20

The purpose of this announcement is to
inform all payers/transmitters, who file
information returns magnetically or elec-
tronically with Internal Revenue Service
(IRS) Martinsburg Computing Center, of
a change in the record format for tax year
1998 returns to be filed in calendar year
1999.  Due to the century date change,
legislative changes, and proposed future
expansion, the record size will be in-
creased from the current 420 positions to
750 positions.  This will enable IRS to
capture all data required to be filed.  Sev-
eral examples of changes are: the number
of money fields have been expanded from
9 to 12, and blank fields have been added
to enable IRS to capture more complete
name and address information in the fu-
ture.  Although the record has changed,
much of the information is data already
requested in the present format.

Publication 1220, Specifications for
Filing Forms 1098, 1099 series, 5498,
5498–MSA and W–2G Magnetically or
Electronically, is being revised and is
scheduled to be available on the Informa-
tion Reporting Program Bulletin Board
System (IRP–BBS) by May 1998 in an ef-
fort to give payers/transmitters as much
time as possible to incorporate the
changes into their programs.  The tele-
phone number for the IRP–BBS is 304-
264-7070.  IRS is planning additional In-
formation Reporting Seminars to assist
filers with the new format.  

Due to the fact we are unable to discuss
any other changes in detail until the publi-
cation has gone through all necessary
clearances, no further information will be
provided at this time. 
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